
Gifts



12414471
ARCANA BAMBOO BLUETOOTH®

SPEAKER

Bamboo Bluetooth® speaker with a 3W
output and crystal clear sound. A compact

speaker with a built-in 500 mAh battery
that allows for up to 3 hours of usage at

maximum volume. Bluetooth® 5.0
working range is up to 10 meters.

Packaged in a gift box and delivered with
an instruction manual (both made of

sustainable material). Micro-USB charging
cable is included.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10066701
HULAN 540 ML COPPER VACUUM

INSULATED STAINLESS STEEL
BOTTLE WITH BAMBOO LID

Simplicity and elegance makes this bottle
the perfect gift. The bottle features a

stainless steel lid with organic bamboo
detail on top. With its double-walled

copper vacuum insulated 18/8 stainless
steel, drinks stay hot or cold for several

hours.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12415590
RIFF WIRELESS HEADPHONES

WITH MICROPHONE

Durable wireless headphones with a soft
headband for optimal comfort. The

headphones includes a microphone to
answer phone calls, and the over-ear
design of the earcups gives a perfect
sound experience. Built-in 200 mAh

lithum battery that provides a playback
time up to 4 hours. The headphones can
be fully charged in 2 hours. Bluetooth®

5.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10068001
NORDRE 350 ML COPPER VACUUM

INSULATED MUG

The Nordre double-walled copper vacuum
insulated 18/8 stainless steel mug with

outdoor design is part of the Nordic
collection. The on-trend powder-spray

finish makes the mug extra durable. BPA-
free, tested and approved under German
Food Safe Legislation (LFGB). Tested and

approved for phthalates content
according to REACH regulations. Volume

capacity is 350 ml.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12425202
MEDAKE 10W BAMBOO WIRELESS

CHARGER

10W bamboo wireless charger integrated
with phone holder, compatible with all Qi
devices (iPhone 8 or above and Android

devices that supports wireless charging).
Delivered in gift box with an instruction

manual (both made of sustainable
materials). ABS Plastic, Bamboo wood.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10071202
SPRING 500 ML COPPER VACUUM

INSULATED BOTTLE

Copper vacuum insulated stainless steel
bottle with clean design. The insulated

18/8 stainless steel construction prevents
condensation on the inside of the bottle,

and the on-trend matte powder-spray
finish makes it extra durable. BPA-free,

tested and approved under German Food
Safe Legislation (LFGB).

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12425302
BRAAVOS MINI TWS EARBUDS

Extremely compact True Wireless earbuds
with great sound performance. The

charging case is 1/3 smaller and the
earbuds are 50% smaller than the

Braavos 2 earbuds. Features Bluetooth®
5.3 that support up to 10 meters

connection distance.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12428290
MOVE ULTRA IPX5 OUTDOOR

SPEAKER WITH RGB MOOD LIGHT

The Move Ultra is an IPX5 certified
Bluetooth® speaker that is perfect for

outdoor activities like a picnic, BBQ,
beach or pool party. The 5W speaker
output provides a nice and powerful
sound quality. The built-in 1200mAh

battery ensures up to 4 hours of playback
time at max volume with RGB mood light
ON, and 5 hours playback time with RGB

OFF. Bluetooth® 5.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12428002
HYBRID AMBIANCE SPEAKER

Powerful ambiance Bluetooth® speaker
with 5W output, and an attractive design
with built-in candle dimmer to provide a
romantic atmosphere. The item can also
be used separately as a light, where the

brightness is easily controlled by rotating
the body. The built-in 1000mAh
rechargeable battery ensures 2.

AVAILABLE COLOURS


