
Gift sets



10651500
HÉMISPHÈRE ROLLERBALL PEN

A pure, simple, timeless line. Hémisphère
– both highly practical and discreet –

slides, unnoticed, into a pocket, bag or
diary. A design that combines natural,

seductive elegance with true magnetism.
Incl. Waterman gift box. Delivered with

one rollerball refill. Exclusive design.
Stainless Steel.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10651600
HÉMISPHÈRE BALLPOINT PEN

A pure, simple, timeless line. Hémisphère
– both highly practical and discreet –

slides, unnoticed, into a pocket, bag or
diary. A design that combines natural,

seductive elegance with true magnetism.
Incl. Waterman gift box. Delivered with

one refill. Exclusive design. Stainless
Steel.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10711100
TACTICAL NOTEBOOK GIFT SET

Exclusive A5 sized design notebook with
Thermo PU cover, black ribbon page

marker, magnetic closure and 80 sheets
of 80gsm cream lined paper. Paired with

the Tactical click action ballpoint pen.
Both items packed in a ''LUXE'' gift box.
Size notebook: 13.5 x 20.5 cm. Length

pen: 14 cm. Diameter pen: 1.05cm.
Thermo PU Plastic.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10711400
BARITONE BALLPOINT PEN AND

WALLET GIFT SET

Two essential items in one stylish gift set.
The leather-wrapped ballpoint pen comes

with a matching wallet. Exclusively
designed and packed in a ''LUXE'' gift

box. Metal, Imitation leather.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10721500
VINCENZO DUO PEN GIFT SET

Exclusively designed pen set consisting of
a stylus ballpoint pen and rollerball pen.

Both pens feature a graphite bottom
barrel complemented with a polished

chrome upper barrel. Incl. a premium
black ink refill and rubberized stylus tip

ideal for touchscreens such as tablets and
smartphones. Packed in a ''LUXE'' gift box

(17x5.5x3cm). ABS Plastic, Metal.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10733900
SMART WRITING SET 2.0

The Smart writing set 2.0 contains the
bestselling classic Moleskine notebook
(large ruled), a Smart pen, a magnetic

charger and a refill. Moleskine recognizes
that in our everyday lives we instinctively
use a combination of analogue and digital

tools.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10775881
IM BALLPOINT PEN

The Parker IM is an ideal partner with
unlimited potential. The sleek tapered

shape pairs seamlessly with innovative
designs to make a striking statement. The
finish trims compliment the body, making

this Parker pen the perfect writing
instrument for students and

professionals.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10775981
IM ROLLERBALL PEN

The Parker IM is an ideal partner with
unlimited potential. The sleek tapered

shape pairs seamlessly with innovative
designs to make a striking statement. The
finish trims compliment the body, making

this Parker pen the perfect writing
instrument for students and

professionals.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10777790
FELICE 12 DAYS OF GIFTING

STATIONERY BOX

This gift box contains 12 items of
stationery varying from a mini notebook
to a writing card set, name tags, paper

clips, a ballpoint pen, gold marker, washi
tape and more. Each day offers a
different piece of stationery to be

revealed and enjoyed throughout the year
to come. Cardboard paper.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



42001101
CLASSIC NOTEBOOK AND PARKER

PEN GIFT BOX

Notebook and pen gift box with exclusive
design. Any Parker Jotter pen can be

combined with the JournalBooks Classic
hard cover (106181), Classic flex cover
(106808), or the Nova bound notebook

(107395). Pen and notebook are not
included with this item and need to be

purchased separately. Cardboard paper.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10780031
JOTTER CRACKER PEN GIFT SET

The Parker icon, Jotter, is the preferred
choice for active writers who need pens
wherever they go. Now this perfect gift
comes in a fun, Parker cracker gift box.

Delivered with patented Quick Flow
ballpoint refill. Exclusive design. ABS

Plastic.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



42001255
WATERMAN PREMIUM DUO PEN

GIFT BOX

Premium duo pen gift box with magnetic
closure suitable for two different writing
modes to provide a flexible fine writing

experience. Choose for example between
a ballpoint/rollerball, or ballpoint/fountain
pen combination. The gift box also has a

storage area for two cartridges or one
rollerball refill. Includes warranty card.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



42001382
PARKER PREMIUM DUO PEN GIFT

BOX

Premium duo pen gift box with magnetic
closure suitable for two different writing
modes to provide a flexible fine writing

experience. Choose for example between
a ballpoint/rollerball, or ballpoint/fountain
pen combination. The gift box also has a

storage area for two cartridges or one
rollerball refill. Includes warranty card.

AVAILABLE COLOURS


