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12411700
FUTURE BAMBOO/FABRIC 6000 MAH
WIRELESS POWER BANK

A more sustainable choice! The Bamboo / fabric
6000 mAh wireless power bank is made of real
bamboo and eco cotton fabric. It features a Grade A
6000 mAh Lithium Polymer battery and allows for
smartphone charging without cables. Supports
wireless charging up to 1A for devices that have
wireless charging functionality.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10772414
JOTTER XL MONOCHROME BALLPOINT PEN

With the Jotter XL Monochrome Collection, Parker
introduces four contemporary, fully monochromatic
finishes to its range. From the subtle yet distinctive
Black and Silver finishes to the boldly self-assured
Gold and Rose Gold, the eye-catching quartet is the
perfect balance between timeless elegance and a
strikingly modern aesthetic.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12415890
ANTON ANC HEADPHONES

Headphones with integrated microphone and Active
Noise Cancellation system (ANC), which heavily
reduces outside noise, creating a perfect music
experience. Features an around-ear fit for optimal
wearing comfort and has a button control system to
access all functions easily. Bluetooth® 5.0
supporting a maximum distance of up to 10 meters.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10253571
TAIHU BAMBOO TABLET HOLDER

Tablet holder made from bamboo that fits almost all
tablets and mobile phones. The viewing angle can
be adjusted, making it the perfect accessory while
working, watching a movie or in the kitchen reading
a a recipe while cooking. The bamboo used is from
sustainable, environmentally and socially
responsible sources. The tablet holder has a size of
16.5 x 16 x 22 cm.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12418790
MAGCLICK 5000MAH 5W WIRELESS
MAGNETIC POWER BANK

Wireless charging magnetic powerbank that can be
attached to the back of the phone (iPhone
12/iPhone 12 Pro /iPhone 12 Pro MAX) to charge
the device. The 5W wireless charger is compatible
with all Qi devices (iPhone 8 or above and Android
devices that supports wireless charging), and for
other phones it can be used as a regular wireless
powerbank.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12418953
MOVE MAX IPX6 OUTDOOR SPEAKER WITH
RGB MOOD LIGHT

Powerful 7W IPX6 certified wireless speaker with
RGB mood light, that is perfect for outdoor activities
like a picnic, BBQ, beach or pool party. The built-in
1500mAh battery ensures up to 4 hours of playback
time at max volume with RGB mood light ON.
Bluetooth® 5.1 with a range up to 10 meters.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12419490
RISE TABLET STAND

Compact tablet holder made of aluminum. The
viewing angle can be adjusted to support all needs,
making this the perfect accessory for conference
calls, broadcasts, live streaming, or simply to watch
a movie. The bottom has anti-slip material to
prevent it from moving. Delivered in a premium
kraft paper box with a colourful sticker. Aluminium.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12417701
ANTON EVO ANC EARBUDS

True Wireless Stereo (TWS) earbuds with Active
Noice Cancellation (ANC), reducing up to 20dB of
noise providing a fantastic music experience even in
the train, plane, bus, or other places with a lot of
unwanted noise.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10067601
IRIS 330 ML GLASS MUG

Double-walled 330 ml borosilicate glass mug, ideal
for serving your favourite latte macchiato, hot
chocolate or any hot drink. This mug is made of
100% durable borosilicate glass that conserves the
freshness of the beverage, and it does not contain
any harmful chemicals.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



10067901
ZIGGS 650 ML RECYCLED PLASTIC WATER
BOTTLE

The Ziggs reusable water bottle is single-wall
constructed and features a stylish bamboo lid. The
body of the bottle is made from recycled plastic.
BPA-free, tested and approved under German Food
Safe Legislation (LFGB). Tested and approved for
phthalates content according to REACH regulations.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



12424502
RIFF WHEAT STRAW BLUETOOTH®
HEADPHONES WITH MICROPHONE

Comfortable, lightweight and durable wireless
headphones with Bluetooth® 5.0 for a stable
connection, and built-in microphone to answer
phone calls. The headphones are foldable and the
over-ear design provides a perfect sound
experience. The built-in 200 mAh lithum battery
allows a playback time up to 4 hours and can be
fully recharged in 2 hours.

AVAILABLE COLOURS



37525500
CUPRITE LONG SLEEVE WOMEN'S GOTS
ORGANIC SHIRT

Sustainable promotional apparel. Semi-spread
collar. Engraved pearl buttons. Adjustable cuff with
single pleat. Satin piping at inside neck. Contrast
coloured stitching on sleeve placket and bottom
buttonhole placket. Woven label. Poplin of 100%
GOTS certified organic cotton, 121 g/m2.

AVAILABLE COLOURS


